
 

 

Directors Michelle K. Holoubek and Carla Ji-Eun Kim Named 
 “Women Worth Watching® in STEM” by Profiles in Diversity Journal 

Washington D.C. (June 18, 2020) – Sterne, Kessler, Goldstein & Fox is pleased to announce 
that Directors Michelle K. Holoubek and Carla Ji-Eun Kim have been recognized by Profiles in 
Diversity Journal in the 2020 edition of “Women Worth Watching® in STEM.” According to the 
editors of this special edition of “Women Worth Watching®” that is focused on science, 
technology, engineering, and math, honorees “are high performing, purpose-driven leaders who 
create value for other women and the companies, organizations and agencies behind them.” 

In Holoubek’s profile, she praises the women in STEM who encourage young girls to push pass 
the societal biases they face and pursue careers in STEM. “Sometimes, showing what’s 
possible gives confidence to those who are considering entering a field, which in turn increases 
the number of people who actually do it,” she said. 

Kim emphasizes the importance of accepting and moving on from failure, as well as the need to 
shatter the internal barriers that prevent women from finding their confidence. “As women in 
STEM, we must overcome our own self-imposed limitations – limitations that we lock ourselves 
into when we think, ‘I can’t do this. I am scared. Should I do it? Can I demand this?’… But that’s 
an illusion. We must break the box open, expand the box, then break it again,” she explained. 

Launched in 2002, the “Women Worth Watching®” publication aims to recognize the change 
makers and leaders who have recorded outstanding achievements throughout their careers. 
Award recipients are selected following nominations made by their employers, colleagues, 
peers, and mentors. 

The full publication can be found here. Holoubek’s and Kim’s full profiles can be found on page 
51 and page 52, respectively. 

About Sterne, Kessler, Goldstein & Fox 
Based in Washington, D.C. and renowned for more than four decades for dedication to the 
protection, transfer, and enforcement of intellectual property rights, Sterne, Kessler, Goldstein & 
Fox is one of the most highly regarded intellectual property specialty law firms in the world. Its 
team of attorneys, registered patent agents, students, and technical specialists include some of 
the country's most respected practitioners of IP law tackling innovations across a broad 
spectrum of industries. The firm’s practitioners hold over 50 masters and over 50 doctorate 
degrees in science or engineering and represent Fortune 500 companies, entrepreneurs, start-
ups, inventors, venture capital firms, and universities in a client service driven environment that 
is welcoming, inclusive, and intellectually stimulating. Visit the firm online at sternekessler.com. 
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